Energy Logistics lraq Ltd

Apt.1, Block 10, Baharan Complex
Sulaimaniyah, Iraq, SC
receivables@energylogistics-ig.com

www.energylogistics-ig.com

INVOICE

BILLTO

Starlight Airlines
P6 / 40 Saif Zone
P.O. Box 8423
Sharjah

Dubai UAE

ORDER NO
N/A

ACTIVITY

Domestic
Transport

Please make your payment to
ENERGY LOGISTICS IRAQ LTD

Account:

ENERGY

LOGISTICS
INVYOICE SL3242
DATE 18/09/2023
TERMS Net 15
DUE DATE 03/10/2023
OUR REF OTHER REF
3139 N/A
DESCRIPTION QTyY RATE AMOUNT
1 ton Pickup transporting equipment from Erbil to Khormor on 1 250.00 250.00
17th Sep 2023
BALANCE DUE USD 250.00

Bank BBAC s.a,l. SULAYMANIYAH branch

Swift code: BBACIQBA
Account No. 429360002

IBAN: 1Q94 BBAC 0033 7042 9360 002




ENERGY

Energy Logistics Iraq Ltd
Apt.1, Block 10
Baharan Complex

Sulaymaniyah
Iraq

DELIVERY NOTE

Customer

Starlight

Our Reference Date

3139 18/09/2023

Collection Details
Erbil

Vehicle Reg No:

Delivery Details
Khormor

Delivery Date: 17/09/2023 Delivery Ref:

Collection Date:17/09/2023 Collection Ref : Delivery Time:
Collection Time
Number & type of Package Description of Good Gross Weight Cube
1 ton Pickup transporting equipment from Erbil to 0.00
Khormor on 17th Sep 2023
SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS: Dims Packages Length  Width Height
[ TRAILER NO. ) =% e o

Behalf of

Energy Logistics Irag Ltd
Awder Elham Tel: 07701411075
E-mall: Ops@energylogistics-ig.com

RECEIVED IN GOOD ORDER AND CONDITION; REMARKS For and on

RECEIVED BY NAME (BLOCK CAPITALS)

[ G2
o
-
DATE:
TIME:

) ¢

Energy Lagistics Iraq limited, Registration Number: 5347




Receivables-EL

— —
From: Ala Akram <ala@starlightairline.com>
Sent: Monday, September 18, 2023 9:58 AM
To: Operations-EL
Cc: Asan Faidhalla; Receivables-EL; OPS Coordinator-EL; ‘Jegar StarLight'
Subject: RE: pickup to Khormor// LOG1373L// 157-77554131
Attachments: Delivery note 3139-stamped.pdf

Dear Kak. Awder,

Attached stamped POD. Please send your invoice with $250.

ALA AKRAM
Senior Project Management

STARLIGHT AIRLINES

Kurdistan [ Iraq | Mob # + 964 (0)751 810 3857
Erbil, Dream City Villa No. 1176

Email: Ala@starlightairline.com

Web: www.starlightairline.com

WCA ID 77416
’:_) ( o."x.'».) %
A Link WCA

From: Operations-EL [mailto:ops@ENERGYLOGISTICS-1Q.COM]

Sent: Monday, September 18, 2023 9:41 AM

To: ala@starlightairline.com

Cc: Asan Faidhalla <Asan@ENERGYLOGISTICS-1Q.COM>; Receivables-EL <receivables@ENERGYLOGISTICS-IQ.COM>;
OPS Coordinator-EL <opscoordinator@ENERGYLOGISTICS-IQ.COM>

Subject: pickup to Khormor

Dear Ala,
Please sign attached and return .

Best Regards

Awder Elham

Operations Manager
Ops@energylogistics-ig.com
+964(0) 770 141 1075




