Energy Logistics Iraq Ltd
Apt.1, Block 10, Baharan Complex
Sulaimaniyah, Iraq, SC

receivables @energylogistics-iq.com
www . energylogistics-iq.com

ENERGY

INVOICE

BILLTO INVOICE SL3085

Starlight Airlines DATE 22/05/2023

P6 / 40 Saif Zone TERMS Net 15

P.O. Box 8423 DUE DATE 06/06/2023

Sharjah

Dubai UAE

ORDER NO. OUR REF OTHER REF

N/A 3019 N/A

ACTIVITY DESCRIPTION QTY RATE AMOUNT
Domestic 5 ton truck transporting equipment from Erbil to Khormor on 1 700.00 700.00
Transport 22.05.2023

Please make vaur payment to: BALANCE DUE USD 700.00

Account: ENERGY LOGISTICS IRAQ LTD
Bank: BBAC s.al SULAYMANIYAH branch

Swift code: BBACIQBA
Account No 429360002

IBAN: Q84 BBAC 0033 7042 9360 002
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Energy Logistics Iraq Ltd

Apt.1, Block 10

Baharan Complex

Sulaymaniyah
Iraq

Customer
Starlight

Our Reference

3019

DELIVERY NOTE

bate
22/05/2023

Collection Details

Erbil

Vehicle Reg No:
Collection Date:21/05/2023 Collection Ref:
Collection Time

Delivery Details
Khormor

Delivery Date: 22/05/2023 Delivery Ref:
Delivery Time:

Number & type of Package

IS_PECIAL INSTRUCTIONS:

Description of Good Gross Weight

5 ton truck transporting equipment from Erbil to
Khormor on 22.05.2023

Cube
0.00

Dims Packages Length

TRAILER NO.

Width

Height

Behalf of

Energy Logistics Iraq Ltd
Awder Elham Tel: 07701411075
E-mail: Ops@energylogistics-ig.com

RECEIVED IN GOOD ORDER AND CONDITION: REMARKS For and on | RECEIVED BY NAME (BLOCK CAPITALS)

DATE:

TIME:

Energy Logistics Iraq limited, Registration Number: 5347
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Receivables-EL
From: Ala Akram <ala@starlightairline.com>
Sent: Monday, May 22, 2023 10:41 AM
To: Operations-EL
Cc: 'Jegar Starlight'; Receivables-EL
Subject: RFQ for FCL ex USA to KM- LOG11296S
Attachments: Delivery note.docx
Kak. Awder,

Attached signed DN. Send us your invoice please. Thanks.

ALA AKRAM
Senior Project Management

STARLIGHT AIRLINES
Kurdistan | Iraq | Mob # + 964 (0)751 810 3857
Erbil, Dream City Villa No. 1176

Email: Ala@starlightairlis

Web: ww.starlightal M)

WCA ID 77416
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From: Operations-EL [mailto:ops@ENERGYLOGISTICS-1Q.COM]

Sent: Monday, May 22, 2023 10:19 AM

To: Ala Akram <ala@starlightairline.com>

Cc: 'Jegar Starlight' <Erbil@starlightmaritime.com>; Receivables-EL <receivables@ENERGYLOGISTICS-1Q.COM>
Subject: RE: RFQ for FCL ex USA to KM- LOG11296S

Dear Ala,
Could you please sign attached delivery note and returned .

Best Regards

Awder Elham

Operations Manager
Ops@energylogistics-ig.com
+964(0) 770 141 1075
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The content of this emall is confidential and intended for the recipient spacifiad in message enly 1t s strictly forbidden 1o share any part of this message with any third party, without a
winitien consane of the sandar If you recaived this message by mistake. plezse -eply to this massage and follow with its deletion, so that v e can ensura such 3 mistake does nat eccur in
the future

From: Ala Akram <ala@starlightairline.com>

Sent: Sunday, May 21, 2023 2:07 PM

To: Operations-EL <ops@ENERGYLOGISTICS-IQ.COM>
Cc: 'Jegar Starlight' <Erbil@starlightmaritime.com>
Subject: RFQ for FCL ex USA to KM- LOG11296S

Dear Kak. Awder,

As agreed on $700, please arrange 5 ton truck to collect the shipment from our WH.

Total Weight : 1,200 Kgs ( Approx) / 4 packages

Goods : Platform ( Non Stackable)

Crate 1:249x122x122 Cms/377 Kgs
Crate 2 : 249x122x183 Cms/ 299 Kgs

Goods : Oilfield parts ( Non Stackable)
Pkg 3 : 105x79x71 Cms/354 Kgs
Pkg 4: 97x69x87 Cms/167 Kgs

Mrs. Ala Akram
Senior Project Management



