Energy Logistics lraq Ltd
Apt.1, Block 10, Baharan Complex
Sulaimaniyah, Iraq, SC

receivables @energylogistics-ig.com

www.energylogistics-ig.com

ENERGY

INVOICE

BILL TO INVOICE SL3083

Starlight Airlines DATE 21/05/2023

P6 / 40 Saif Zone TERMS Net 15

P.O. Box 8423 DUE DATE 05/06/2023

Sharjah

Dubai UAE

ORDER NO OUR REF OTHER REF

N/A 3017 N/A

ACTIVITY DESCRIPTION QTyYy RATE AMOUNT
Domestic 40 ft truck transporting equipment from Erbil to Khormor and 1 1,100.00 1,100.00
Transport stand by for 2 days on 20th May 2023

Pleasa make your paymant o BALANCE DUE USD 1 ,100_00

Account: EMERGY LOGISTICS IRAQ LTD
Bank: BBAC s al. SULAYMANIYAH branch

Swift code:  BBACIQBA
Account No. 429360002

IBAN 1Q84 BBAC 0033 7042 G380 002

We appieciate your business
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Energy Logistics Iraq Ltd
Apt.1, Block 10
Baharan Complex

Sulaymaniyah

Iraq

Customer

Starlight

Our Reference - Date R |

3017 21/05/2023

Collection Details Delivery Details

Erbil Khormor

\Vehicle Reg No: Delivery Date: 21/05/2023 Delivery Ref:

Collection Date:20/05/2023 Collection Ref: Delivery Time:

Collection Time

Number & type of Package Description of Good Gross Weight Cube
40 ft truck transporting equipment from Erbil to 0.00
Khormor and stand by for 2 days on 20th May 2023

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS: Dims Packages Length  Width Height

TRAILER NO.

RECEIVED IN GOOD ORDER AND CONDITION: REMARKS For and on
Behalf of

RECEIVED BY NAME (BLOCK CAPITALS)

Energy Logistics Iraq Ltd
Awder Elham Tel: 07701411075
E-mail: Ops@energylogistics-ig.com

DATE:

TIME:

Energy Logistics Iraq limited, Registration Number: 5347
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L7203
Receivables-EL
From: Operations-EL
Sent: Sunday, May 21, 2023 2:24 PM
To: Ala Akram
Cc: 'Erbil Starlight Maritime'; Asan Faidhalla; Receivables-EL
Subject: RE: LOG1265S- Sea freight ex Sledgehammer India- PO# 4300004008- Partial order/
WA 5517 / INV6616-MENA1342-A // CNTR#MRSU4322589
Attachments: Delivery note 3017 Starlight.pdf
Dear Ala,

Could you please sign attached delivery note and returned .

Best Regards
Awder Elham
Operations Manager

Ops@energylogistics-ig.com

+964(0) 770 141 1075
Energy Logistics Iraq Ltd
www.energylogistics-ig.com
info@energylogistics-ig.com
Apt.1, Block 10, Baharan Complex, Sulaymaniyah, Iraq
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-thice:

The content of thts smait Is confidental and intended for the recipient specifizd 1 message cnly 11 is strati, foroidden to share any part of this message with any third party, wethout 2
wirtten consent of the sander, If you receivad this message by mistake, clease reply to this massage and follow with its deletion so that we can ensure such 2 mstake does not occur in
the future

From: Ala Akram <ala@starlightairline.com>

Sent: Sunday, May 21, 2023 2:10 PM

To: Operations-EL <ops@ENERGYLOGISTICS-1Q.COM>

Cc: 'Erbil Starlight Maritime' <erbil@starlightmaritime.com>; Asan Faidhalla <Asan@ENERGYLOGISTICS-1Q.COM>;
Receivables-EL <receivables@ENERGYLOGISTICS-IQ.COM>

Subject: RE: LOG1265S- Sea freight ex Sledgehammer India- PO# 4300004008- Partial order/ WA 5517 / INV6616-
MENA1342-A // CNTR#MRSU4322589

Dear Kak. Awder,

As discussed, please send your DN with total $1100. Thanks,

ALA AKRAM
Senior Project Management





