Enerdy Logistics Iraq Ltd
Apt.1, Blotk 10, Baharan Complex T
Sulaimamyah, Iraq, SC
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INVOICE
2591

Starlight Airlines 04/09/2022
P6 / 40 Saif Zone Net 15
P.O. Box 8423 19/09/2022
Sharjah

Dubai UAE
N/A N/A

ACTIVITY DESCRIPTION QTY AMOUNT
Domestic 5 ton truck transporting equipment from Erbil to Khormor on 29th 1 550.00 550.00
Transport August 2022

USD 550.00




3 Energy Logistics Iraq Ltd
e Apt.1, Block 10
IJ ] Baharan
<&y Complex
A IrETr-sys Sulaymaniyah
=NEIRG Iraq

DELIVERY
Customer NOTE

Starlight Airline

Our Reference Date

2628 29/08/2022
Collection Details Delivery Details
Erbil Khormor LPG Plant

Vehicle Reg No:
Collection Date:29/08/2022 Collection Ref:
Collection Time

Number & type of Package Description of Good Gross Weight Cube
5 ton truck transporting equipment from Erbil to Khormor on 0.00
29th August 2022

Delivery Date:30/08/2022 Delivery Ref:
Delivery Time:

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS: Dims Packages Length Width Height

TRAILER NO.

RECEIVED IN GOOD ORDER AND CONDITION: REMARKS |RECEIVED BY NAME (BLOCK CAPITALS)
For and on

Behalf of

Energy Logistics Iraq Ltd

Awder Elham Tel: 07701411075 DATE:
E-mail: Ops@eneraylogistics-ig.com ’

TIME:

Energy Logistics Iraq limited, Registration
Number: 5347



||__ 254

Receivablis-EL
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From: Ala Akram <marketing.ebl@starlightairline.com>
Sent: Sunday, September 04, 2022 10:11 AM
To: Operations-EL; Receivables-EL
Cc: 'Erbil Starlight Maritime'; Asan Faidhalla
Subject: RE: LOG1168
Attachments: Delivery note 2628...pdf

Good morning Kak. Awder,

Attached signed delivery note.
Appreciate sending your invoice on below job.

Yours sincerely,

Mrs. Ala Akram
Logistics Specialist
)
(o Starlight Airlines
Kurdistan | Iraq | Mob # + 964 (0)751 810 3857

Erbil, Dream City Villa No. 1176
Email: marketing.ebl@starlightairline.com

Web: www.starlightairline.com

WCA ID 77416
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From: Operations-EL [mailto:ops@ENERGYLOGISTICS-1Q.COM]

Sent: Wednesday, August 31, 2022 11:36 AM

To: Ala Akram <marketing.ebl@starlightairline.com>; Receivables-EL <receivables@ENERGYLOGISTICS-IQ.COM>
Cc: 'Erbil Starlight Maritime' <erbil@starlightmaritime.com>; Asan Faidhalla <Asan@ENERGYLOGISTICS-IQ.COM>
Subject: RE: LOG1168

Hi Ala,

Please find attached signed POD . kindly return signed Delivery note for invoicing purpose .

Kaka Hama,
Please share invoice once you received signed DN



Best Regards

Awder Elham HAS!
Operations Manager ——a
Ops@energylogistics-ig.com
+964(0) 770 141 1075

Energy Logistics Iraq Ltd

7o i www.energylogistics-ig.com
o 5 info@energylogistics-ig.com
‘ f\" .‘2}' Apt.1, Block 10, Baharan Complex, Sulaymaniyah, Irag
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Notice:

The content of this ernail is confidantia! and intended for the recipient spacifiad in message only Itis strictl; forbiddan to share 2ny part of this message viin any third paity, »..thout 3
written conse it of the serder If you receved this message by mistake please 12ply to this message and follev: wth its oeletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not oscui In

the future

From: Ala Akram <marketing.ebl@starlightairline.com>

Sent: Sunday, August 28, 2022 12:10 PM

To: Operations-EL <ops@ENERGYLOGISTICS-1Q.COM>

Cc: 'Erbil Starlight Maritime' <erbil@starlightraritime.com>; Asan Faidhalla <Asan@ENERGYLOGISTICS-10.COM>
Subject: RE: LOG1168

Dear Kak. Awder,

Shipment arrived our WH. Please send your truck.
Attached pictures for your kind reference.

Yours sincerely,

Mrs. Ala Akram
Logistics Specialist

B
QStarlight Airlines

Kurdistan | Irag | Mob # + 964 (0)751 810 3857
Erbil, Dream City Villa No. 1176
Email: marketing.ebl@starlightairline.com

Web: www.starlightairline.com

WCA ID 77416
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From: Operations-EL [mailto:ops@ENERGYLOGISTICS-1Q.COM]

Sent: Wednesday, August 24, 2022 9:24 AM

To: Ala Akram <marketing.ebl@starlightairline.com>

Cc: 'Erbil Starlight Maritime' <erbil@starlightmaritime.com>; Asan Faidhalla <Asan@ENERGYLOGISTICS-1Q.COM>
Subject: RE: LOG1168

Dear Ala,
Please advise loading & Delivery date ?

Best Regards

Awder Elham

Operations Manager
Ops@eneraylogistics-ig.com
+964(0) 770 141 1075

Energy Logistics Iraq Ltd
7 . . www.energylogistics-ig.com
( :] info@energylopistics-ig.com
Apt.1, Block 10, Baharan Complex, Sulaymaniyah, Irag

L & 4 aee

ENERGY JEi7isases ) ¢

¥ nber
& &

NOtICE

The content of this email is cenfidentizl and intended for the recipient specified in message only, It is strictly forbiddzn to share any part of this message with any third party, without a
written consant of the sender If you received this massage by mistake, please reply to this message and follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur in
the future

From: Ala Akram <marketing.ebl@starlightairline.com>

Sent: Tuesday, August 23, 2022 11:51 PM

To: Operations-EL <ops @ENERGYLOGISTICS-10.COM>

Cc: 'Erbil Starlight Maritime' <erbil@starlightmaritime.com>; Asan Faidhalla <Asan@ENERGYLOGISTICS-1Q.COM>
Subject: RE: LOG1168

Dear Kak. Awder,

Truck expected to arrive our Gazna WHS tomorrow,
Please share below details:

Truck plate No.:

Truck type/color:

Driver’s name:

Nationality:

Driver Mobile# (Iraq):

Driver’s passport /ID card (copy):
ETA to KM site:

Driver vaccinated card:
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Yours sincerely,

Mrs. Ala Akram
Logistics Specialist

D
\C;Starlight Airlines

Kurdistan | Irag | Mob # + 964 (0)751 810 3857
Erbil, Dream City Villa No. 1176
Email: marketing.ebl@starlightairline.com

Web: www.starlightairline.com

WCA ID 77416
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From: Ala Akram [mailto:marketing.ebl@starlightairline.com]

Sent: Wednesday, August 17, 2022 3:20 PM

To: 'Operations-EL' <ops@ENERGYLOGISTICS-1Q.COM>

Cc: 'Erbil Starlight Maritime' <erbil@starlightmaritime.com>; 'Asan Faidhalla' <Asan@ENERGYLOGISTICS-1Q.COM>
Subject: RE: LOG1168

Dear Kak. Awder,

Thank you very much for being supportive. ©
Will inform you once shipment arrived our Gazna WH.

Yours sincerely,

Mrs. Ala Akram
Logistics Specialist

3
({Starlight Airlines

Kurdistan | Iraq | Mob # + 964 (0)751 810 3857
Erbil, Dream City Villa No. 1176
Email: marketing.ebl@starlightairline.com

Web: www.starlightairline.com

WCA ID 77416
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Sent: Wednesday, August 17, 2022 2:42 PM

To: Ala Akram <marketing.ebl@starlightairline.com>

Cc: 'Erbil Starlight Maritime' <erbil@starlightmaritime.com>; Asan Faidhalla <Asan@ENERGYLOGISTICS-10.COM>
Subject: RE: LOG1168

Hi Ala ,
Its too difficult to say no . yes your rate confirmed for this time .

Best Regards

Awder Elham

Operations Manager
Ops@energylogistics-ig.com
+964(0) 770 141 1075

Energy Logistics Iraq Ltd
P > www.energylogistics-ig.com
info@energylogistics-ig.com
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Notice:

The content of this email is confidentizl and inlended for the racipient specified in message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part of this message with any third party, without 2
written consent of the sender |f you received this messaze by mistake, please reply to this message and follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such @ mistake does not occur in
the future

From: Ala Akram <marketing.ebl@starlightairline.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 17, 2022 1:27 PM

To: Operations-EL <ops@ENERGYLOGISTICS-10.CON>

Cc: 'Erbil Starlight Maritime' <erbil@starlightmaritime.com>; Asan Faidhalla <Asan@ENERGYLOGISTICS-10.COM>
Subject: RE: LOG1168

Dear Kak. Awder,

Lets proceed with $550 this time please. We have better rates in the market but we would like to deal with you more.

Yours sincerely,

Mrs. Ala Akram



Logistics Specialist
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Kurdistan | Iraq | Mob # + 964 (0)751 810 3857

Erbil, Dream City Villa No. 1176
Email: marketing.ebl@starlightairline.com
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From: Operations-EL [mailto:ops@ENERGYLOGISTICS-1Q,COM]

Sent: Thursday, August 11, 2022 4:17 PM

To: Ala Akram <marketing.ebl@starlightairline.com>

Cc: 'Erbil Starlight Maritime' <erbil@starlightmaritime.com>; Asan Faidhalla <Asan@ENERGYLOGISTICS-1Q.COM>
Subject: RE: LOG1168

Dear Ala,
Unfortunately cannot reduce price as you may aware about situation .

Best Regards

Awder Elham

Operations Manager
Ops@energylogistics-ig.com
+964(0) 770 141 1075

Energy Logistics Iraq Ltd
p’ Eo www.energylogistics-ia.com
( 5 info@energylopistics-iq.com
: / Apt.1, Block 10, Baharan Complex, Sulaymaniyah, irag
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Notice:
The contant of this email is confidential and ntended for the recipient specifizd in message only. Itis suictly forbidden to share any part of this message with any thud party, without a
written consent of the sendar If you 1ecewved this message by mistake, please reply to this massage and follows with its delztion, so that we can ensure such a mistat = does not occur in

the future

From: Ala Akram <marketing.ebl@starlightairline.com>

Sent: Thursday, August 11, 2022 3:44 PM

To: Operations-EL <ops@ENERGYLOGISTICS-1Q.COM>

Cc: 'Erbil Starlight Maritime' <erbil@starlightmarilime.com>; Asan Faidhalla <Asan@ENERGYLOGISTICS-10.COM>
Subject: RE: LOG1168

Dear Kak Awder,



Its too much for 20" truck. Please go ahead with $500.
Appreciate your support.
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Yours sincerely,

Mrs. Ala Akram
Logistics Specialist

)
(o Starlight Airlines

Kurdistan | Iraq | Mob # + 964 (0)751 810 3857
Erbil, Dream City Villa No. 1176
Email: marketing.ebl@starlightairline.corn

Web: www.starlightairline.com

WCA ID 77416
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From: Operations-EL [mailto:ops@ENERGYLOGISTICS-10.COM]

Sent: Thursday, August 11, 2022 3:34 PM

To: Ala Akram <marketing.ebl@starlightairline.com>

Cc: 'Erbil Starlight Maritime' <erbil@starlightmaritime.com>; Asan Faidhalla <Asan@ENERGYLOGISTICS-10.COM>
Subject: RE: LOG1168

Dear Ala,

We can offer for 20 ft truck which rate is 675 USD .

Best Regards

Awder Elham

Operations Manager
Ops@enerqylogistics-ig.com
+964(0) 770 141 1075

Energy Logistics Iraq Ltd
www.energylogistics-ig.com
info@energylogistics-ig.com

Apt 1, Block 10, Baharan Complex, Sulaymaniyah, Iraq
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